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t London Baptists exists to encourage and equip its member churches as they 

pursue their own distinct vision and calling to the local communities in which 
they’re based.  Please pray for the 300 churches of the Association as they 
carry out their mission and ministry in and around the London area. 
 
www.londonbaptist.org.uk 
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A prayer from the Armed Forces Christian Union: 
Quiet Revival – military training bases.  Father God, we thank you for the 
Quiet Revival which is drawing many young men and women across our 
military training bases to find meaning and purpose in a relationship with you.  
We pray for all those who are exploring spiritual things and those who are new 
to faith. Father, we pray that the awakening of the Holy Spirit amongst these 
cohorts will continue and that Military Chaplains will be able to engage and 
encourage them in their faith journey. Amen. 
https://afcu.org.uk/pray-4-our-forces/ 
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t Please pray for the work of our ecumenical instruments: Churches Together in 

England, Cytûn (Churches Together in Wales) and Churches Together in 
Britain and Ireland as they encourage churches to seek a deepening of their 
communion with Christ and with one another, and to proclaim the Gospel 
together by common witness and service. 
 
www.baptist.org.uk/connecting 
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This week we pray for the Northern Baptist Association, committed to 
equipping and enabling churches, missional communities and ministers to 
thrive in their local context.  
 
www.thenba.org.uk  
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t Baptist Colleges prepare women and men for pastoral and missional 

leadership: they train the next generation of accredited Baptist ministers and 
pioneers; they enable those wishing to specialise in chaplaincy, evangelism, 
counselling, pastoral supervision and children’s, youth and families; they 
provide a broad range of courses to enhance the skills of local church leaders; 
and they facilitate theological learning at every level from beginners’ studies to 
doctorates. Please pray for the staff and students at our Baptist Colleges. 
www.baptist.org.uk/colleges 
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